Bid Tabulation Form - 2026 Janitorial and Paper Products

ltem #

Item Description

Unit
Size

Qty

Mad Dog
Facility
Partners

HD Supply
Facilities
Maintenance

Carter Paper
& Packaging,
Inc.

Sam Tell &
Son, Inc.

Pyramid
School
Products

Quill LLC

Kaeb
Sanitary
Supply, Inc.

Angel Soft Facial Tissue
#GPT48580, 2-Ply Tissue, 100 Ct
Box, 30 Boxes per Case

Case

100

$5,425.00

$4,136.00

$4,200.00

$2,801.00 #

$2,469.00 #

$6,399.00

No Bid

2*

Kleenex Cottonelle Toilet Tissue
#17713, 2-Ply, 451 Sheets per
Roll, 60 Rolls per Case

Case

130

$9,730.00

$7,450.30

$8,573.50

$6,710.60 #

$10,007.40

$8,408.40

$8,851.17

3*

Gen JRT1000 JRT Jumbo Bath
Tissue, 9" Diameter, 3.3" Core,

3.6" Wide, White, 2-Ply, 1,000 ft
Roll, 12 Rolls per Case

Case

140

$5,571.00

$4,326.00

$5,565.00

$3,822.00 #

$5,457.20

$7,931.00

$3,843.00

Livi White Toilet Tissue #21724, 2-
Ply, 4" X 3.5", 500 Sheet Roll, 96
Rolls per Case

Case

75

$4,394.00

$4,246.50

$3,686.25

$3,871.50

No Bid

No Bid

$3,307.50

5*

Hard Roll Towel, 7.8" X 350 ft Roll,
Natural Color, 12 Rolls per Case

Case

225

$8,370.00

No Bid

$5,681.25

$5,681.25

No Bid

$5,150.25

$5,415.75

6*

Scottfold Towel #1980, White, 9.4"
X 12.4", 4,375 Towels per Case

Case

250

$16,473.00

$14,225.00

$14,637.25

$18,950.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Household Perforated Paper
Towel Rolls, White, 2-Ply, 11" X 9"
Sheet, 85 Sheet Roll, 30 Rolls per
Case

Case

50

$960.00

$1,679.50

$1,717.50

$1,481.50

$1,672.50

$1,987.50

$1,262.00

Foodservice Towel, Chix #8250,
White & Red, 13" X 24", 150 per
Case

Case

$735.00

$240.25 #

$560.00

$167.75 #

$649.90

No Bid

$695.75

WypAll L40 #KCC05796 Wipers
Centerpull Roll - 10" X 13", White,
200 Wipes per Roll, 2 Rolls per
Case

Case

$201.00

No Bid

$343.00

$462.40

$434.90

No Bid

$414.45

10

15" x 17" Dinner Napkins, 2-Ply,
White, 100 per Package, 30
Packages per Case

Case

$630.00

No Bid

$205.00

$201.20

No Bid

No Bid

$234.50

11

4 oz Paper Cone Cup, Roll, Rim,
5,000 per Case

Case

25

$2,070.00

$3,335.50

$1,967.50

$2,038.50

$1,832.25

$2,501.00

$1,658.00
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12

16 oz Beer Cup, Translucent
Plastic Cup, Dart P16, 20 Sleeves,
50 Sleeve Case, 1,000 Cups per
Case - NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Case

50

$5,250.00

No Bid

$5,050.00

$4,202.50

$3,699.50

$5,365.50

$3,126.50

13

9" Coated Paper Plates, White,
100 per Pack, 10 Packs per Case

Case

20

$595.00

No Bid

$920.00

$969.40

No Bid

$582.00

$687.60

14

Dixie #TM207 Plastic Spoons,
White, 100 per Box, 10 Boxes per
Case

Case

10

$415.00

No Bid

$190.00

$83.00 #

$169.70 #

$266.00

$278.80

15

Dixie #FM207 Plastic Forks,
White, 100 per Box, 10 Boxes per
Case

Case

10

$480.00

No Bid

$181.50

$83.00 #

$259.80

$261.50

$281.60

16

White Plastic Table Cover Rolls,
300 ft Length by 40" Wide, 4 Mil,
White

Roll

30

$323.00

No Bid

$592.50

$688.80

No Bid

No Bid

$538.50

17

Neutral PH No Rinse Floor
Cleaner, Low-Foaming, Use with
Mop or Automatic Scrubber, 4
Gallons per Case

Case

10

$325.00

$302.40

$361.50

$285.80

No Bid

No Bid

$299.40

18

Sanitary Napkin Waxed Bag, 7.5"
X 10", 500 per Case

Case

20

$660.00

$468.40

$538.00

$563.00

$382.80

No Bid

$395.00

19

Buckeye Symmetry Hair, Hand
and Body Foaming Wash,
#90071120. 6 - 1250 ml Refills per
Case

Case

100

$8,830.00

No Bid

No Bid

$8,763.00 #

No Bid

No Bid

$8,160.00

20

Buckeye Symmetry Foaming Hand
Sanitizer, #90051120, 6 - 1200 ml
Refills per Case

Case

$750.00 #

No Bid

No Bid

$664.44 #

No Bid

No Bid

$920.88

21

Renown Antibacterial Foam Hand
Soap, REN02499, 2 - 2000 ml
Refills per Case

Case

100

$3,300.00 #

$4,071.00

No Bid

$8,450.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

22

Purell Advanced with Aloe NXT
Instand Hand Sanitizer Refill, 8 -
1000 ml Refills per Case

Case

20

$1,760.00

$2,150.20

No Bid

$2,010.60

No Bid

$2,879.80

$2,500.00
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23

Bioesque Botanical Disinfectant
Solution, 4 - 1 Gallon Bottles per
Case

Case

15

$1,300.00 #

$1,322.40

No Bid

$666.90 #

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

24

Signature By Johnson Diversey
Hight Performance UHS Floor
Finish, 5 Gallon Bag in Box

Box

$560.00

$861.90

No Bid

$716.88

No Bid

No Bid

$1,008.36

25

Joy or Dawn Dish Soap, 8 - 38 0z
Bottles per Case

Case

15

$950.00

$729.60

$789.75

$813.60

$674.40

$844.80

$674.70

26

Foam Disinfectant Cleaner, High
Foaming, Safe on Porcelain
Surfaces, 20 oz Can, 12 Cans per
Case

Case

10

$340.00

$436.80

$1,080.00

$493.40

$317.80

$472.80

$499.00

27

Lime Rid, Ren02702, 4 Gallons
per Case

Case

10

$520.00

$562.10

$539.00

$414.50 #

No Bid

No Bid

$450.00

28

Low Acid Mint Scented Bowl
Cleaner, Quart Bottle, 12 per Case
- Must be blue color, mint
scented

Case

50

$1,200.00

$1,620.00

$1,687.50

$1,465.00

No Bid

No Bid

$1,344.50

29

Disinfectant Bowl Cleaner with
23% HCI, Quart Size Bottle, 12 per
Case

Case

12

$468.00

$440.64

$410.40

$696.72

No Bid

$414.36

$395.64

30

Fresh Urinal Block #FRE-12-4PS,
Non-para Urinal Block, Cherry
Scent, Pink Color, 4 oz, 12 per
Box, 12 Boxes per Case

Case

$25.00 #

$7.97 #

$22.15 #

$14.04 #

$136.08

$14.66

$120.00

31

Scented Urinal Screens, Cherry
Scent, 12 per Box

Box

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

32

Gray Disposable Urinal Floor Mat
with Non Slip Bottom, 17 1/2" x 20
3/8", Scented, 6 per Case

Case

70

$4,155.48

$3,108.00

$3,500.00

$2,802.10

$3,351.60

$3,479.00

$2,723.00

33

SAS Safety #66517, Raven
Powder-Free Disposable Black
Nitrile 6 Mil Gloves, Medium, 50
Pair per Box, 10 Boxes per Case

Case

40

$672.00 #

$576.40 #

No Bid

$1,444.00 #

$1,996.00 #

No Bid

$3,588.00
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Mad Dog HD Supply | Carter Paper Pyramid Kaeb
Unit Facility Facilities |& Packaging,| Sam Tell & School Sanitary
ltem # Item Description Size | Qty Partners Maintenance Inc. Son, Inc. Products Quill LLC Supply, Inc.

SAS Safety #66518, Raven
Powder-Free Disposable Black
Nitrile 6 Mil Gloves, Large, 50 Pair

34 |per Box, 10 Boxes per Case Case| 50 | $840.00 # $720.50 # No Bid $1,803.50 # | $2,495.00 # No Bid $4,485.00
SAS Safety #66519, Raven
Powder-Free Disposable Black
Nitrile 6 Mil Gloves, X-Large, 50

35 |Pair per Box, 10 Boxes per Case |Case| 50 | $840.00 # $720.50 # No Bid $1,803.50 # | $2,495.00 # No Bid $4,485.00
SAS Safety #66520, Raven
Powder-Free Disposable Black
Nitrile 6 Mil Gloves, 2X-Large, 50

36 |Pair per Box, 10 Boxes per Case |Case| 5 $84.00 # $72.05 # No Bid $394.20 # No Bid No Bid $448.50
Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 75

37 |Count, Lemon Scent, 6 per Case |[Case| 50 | $1,080.00 $1,773.00 $2,080.00 $866.50 # $1,749.00 $1,891.50 $1,629.00
Clorox Hydrogen Peroxide Wipes,

38 |CLO30827, 2 per Case Case| 40 $960.00 $3,272.80 $1,624.00 $2,447.20 $2,279.20 $2,521.60 $2,106.00
Air Sanitizer, Citrus Scent, 12 per

39 |Case Case| 20 | $600.00 # $1,008.00 No Bid $980.20 $759.00 $1,315.20 No Bid
All Purpose Non-Scratch Scrub

40 |Sponge, 6" X 3", 20 per Box Box | 3 $15.00 $57.00 $52.05 $17.22 $53.97 $103.53 $67.50
Green Medium Duty Scour Pad, 6"

41 |X 9", 20 per Box Box | 10 $205.00 $200.00 $335.50 $64.10 $79.80 $51.40 $202.30
Odor-Resistant Multi-Purpose
Cellulose Utility Sponge, 6" X 4" x

42 |1.6", 24 per Box Box | 1 $5.00 No Bid $50.30 $8.75 $28.56 No Bid No Bid
Mr Clean Magic Eraser, Original, 4

43 |per Box Box | 40 $250.00 $316.00 No Bid $1,658.00 $239.60 $242.00 $171.20
Plastic Bottles with Chemical
Resistant Trigger Sprayers, 32 0z
Size With Quantity Graduations on

44 |Bottles Each| 50 $190.00 $61.00 No Bid $3.73 # $62.50 No Bid $72.50
Liquid Bleach - 128 oz Bottle, 6 per

45 |Case Case| 20 $415.00 $566.40 $505.00 $488.20 No Bid $772.00 $694.00
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Mad Dog HD Supply | Carter Paper Pyramid Kaeb
Unit Facility Facilities |& Packaging,| Sam Tell & School Sanitary
ltem # Item Description Size | Qty Partners Maintenance Inc. Son, Inc. Products Quill LLC Supply, Inc.
EZ Reacher #32S Trash Pick Up
46 |Tool Each| 96 | $1,275.00 $1,334.40 No Bid $2,844.48 $2,059.20 No Bid $1,243.20
Rubbermaid 35 Quart WaveBrake
Mop Bucket Combo with
47 |Downward Pressure Wringer Each| 4 $360.00 $545.60 $479.00 $301.68 # $415.80 $439.16 No Bid
Rags, Tee Shirt Material, 25#
48 |Case Case| 40 | $1,950.00 $1,689.20 $1,750.00 $3,107.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wasp & Hornet Killer Jet Spray,
Jet Spray up to 20 Feet, Dielectric
Strength 47,300 Volts, 14 oz Can,
49 |12 Cans per Case Case| 10 | $1,025.00 $658.80 $1,106.00 $793.10 $629.80 $765.40 $705.10
Water-Based Residual Insecticide,
Twin Action Valve and Actuator,
Residual Activity Lasting Up To 3
Months, For Control of Flying and
Crawling Insects Including Fleas,
Lice and Eggs, 17 oz Can, 12 per
50 |Case Case| 2 $135.00 No Bid No Bid $142.70 $109.18 No Bid $126.96
Items with an * will have half of the product delivered with the initial shipment and the second half delivered on or around July 1, 2026.
#  Product bid does not meet minimum specifications set forth in the bid package.




