
                                                                                                                              

  

Peoria Park District  

Addendum 1 

2024 Pool Chemicals 
 

24-04-IFB 

March 14, 2024 

 

Please note the following attachment: 

1. 2023 Pool Chemicals Bid Tabulation Form 

   
 



Bid Tabulation

2023 Pool Chemicals

Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

PH Down Low

Size:  Bulk - Gallon

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%

Size:  Gallon Pumped

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%

Size:  5 Gallon Carboy

Chorine

Size:  1 Gallon Container

Sodium Carbonate (Granular Soda Ash)

Size:  50lb Bag

Sodium Thiosulfate

Size:  50lb Bag

Sodium Bicarbonate

Size: 50lb Bag

Filter Aid EP Sp Grade

Size: 25lb Container

*Minimum of 3 pallets of each 

product must be ordered with a 

freight charge of $1,100.00 per 

order.

1 10,000

2 15,000

$39.00 $585.00 

No bid10

6 5

3 20

4 208

$329.90 

$49.99 $749.85 

$575.00 

No bid

7 15

8 10

5

$640.00 

$43,350.00 

$50,000.00 

No bid

$2,079.48 $1,067.04 

$469.90 

No bid

$39.99 per 

case of 4

$46.99 

$2.89 

$5.00 

No bid

No bid

Leslie's Poolmart, Inc. *
Item # Description Qty

Hawkins Inc.

$32.99 

$32.00 

$5.13 

$115.00 


